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Subject:  Clarification to ER 1110-2-111, USACE Bridge Safety Program, for short span 
bridges, non-public access bridges, and pedestrian bridges, and new “CEBIS Lite” inventory and 
report format. 
  
Applicability:  Guidance  
  
1.  Purpose:  This bulletin announces the availability of two documents, “ER 1110-2-111 
Clarification Matrix for Inspection of USACE Short Span Bridges, Non-Public Access Bridges, 
and Pedestrian Bridges” (dated January 2010) and “CEBIS Lite – Standard Inventory Data and 
Report Content” (dated January 2010).  The Clarification Matrix is for use in determining 
inspection requirements, inspector qualifications, report format, and inspection intervals for 
USACE owned or maintained bridges not reportable to the Federal Highway Administration.  
The CEBIS Lite document outlines a simplified bridge inspection data inventory and report 
format that may be used for certain types of bridges at the discretion of the District Bridge Safety 
Program Manager, as indicated by the Clarification Matrix.  Both documents can be downloaded 
from the Corps of Engineers Bridge Inventory System (CEBIS) website: 
https://cebis.wes.army.mil under “BMS”. 
  
2.  Background:  Districts have been interpreting ER 1110-2-111 requirements inconsistently for 
short span bridges, non-public access bridges, and pedestrian bridges.  In addition, the standard 
CEBIS data, report, and QC/QA requirements that are geared towards significant public vehicle 
bridges can be overly costly and time consuming for some of these types of bridges.  The 
Clarification Matrix document expands on the ER definitions, provides lower-bound limits for 
mandatory reporting and allows District Bridge Safety Program Managers flexibility in setting 
required inspector qualifications and report format for certain types of bridges.  “CEBIS Lite” 
was developed as a simplified “condition assessment” type report format that may be used in 
accordance with the Clarification Matrix. 
  
3.  Applicability:  This ECB applies to all FY2010 and future inspections of USACE owned or 
maintained short span bridges, non-public access bridges, and pedestrian bridges on Civil Works 
projects.  Both referenced documents will be incorporated into a future update of ER 1110-2-
111.  Districts are requested to review their inventory of all bridges and culverts at their projects 
and ensure applicable inspection and reporting requirements are being met in accordance with 
ER 1110-2-111 and this ECB.  Where allowed by the Clarification Matrix and determined 
appropriate by the District Bridge Safety Program Manager, “CEBIS Lite – Standard Inventory 
Data and Report Content” should be used as a template for inspections.  Reports in the “CEBIS 
Lite” format will need to be entered by the District into an electronic database, available later 
this year.  
 














